Bid No. 11669
Trash Can Liner Price Agreement

District Wide
All American Poly Boritex Inc.
Virgin Recycled Virgin Recycled
40 mil 7-10 gallon 40 mil 7-10 gallon A mil 7-10 gallon .35mil 7-10 gallon
1 500/case 23 x 25. 500/case 23 x 25 500/case 23x 25 1,000/case 24 x 24 No bid
$15.37/case $15.37/case $16.70/case
40 mil 12-16 gdlon 40 mil 12-16 gdlon A0 mil 12-16 gallon .35 mil 12-16 gdlon
2 500/case 23 x 33. 500/ case 23 x 33 500/ case 23 x 33 1,000/case 24 x 33 No bid
$20.02/case $20.02/case $22.95/case
.75 mil 33 gdlon .75 mil 33 galon .75 33 gdlon .80 mil 33 gallon
3 150/case 33 x 40. 150/case 33 x 40. 150/case 33 x 40. 150/case 33 x 39 No bid
$26.17/case $26.17/case $11.20/case
.75 mil 45 galon .75 mil 45 gdlon .75 mil 45 galon .80 mil 45 galon
4 | 100/case 40 x 46. 100/case 40 x 46. 100/case 40 x 46. 100/case 40 x 46 No bid
$10.30/case $10.30/case $10.60/case
.60 mil 33 gallon .60 mil 33 galon .60 mil 33 gallon .58 mil 33 galon
5 250/case 33 x 39. 250/case 33 x 39. 250/case 33 x 39. 250/case 33x 19 No bid
$17.57/case $17.57/case $13.50/case
.65 mil 44 galon .65 mil 44 galon .65 mil 44 gallon .70 mil 44 gdlon
6 100/case 43 x 47. 100/case 43 x 47. 100/case 43 x 47. 100/case 43 x 47 No bid
$11.32/case $11.32/case $10.60/case
.65 mil 55-60 gdlon .65 mil 55-60 gdlon .65 55-60 gallon .58 mil 55-60 galon
7 100/case 43 x 47. 100/case 43 x 47. 100/case 43 x 47. 200/case 43 x 47 No bid
$10.64/case $10.64/case $16.95/case
1.7 mil 55-60 galon 1.7 mil 55-60 gallon 1.7 mil 55-60 gallon 1.7 mil 55-60 galon
8 50/case 38 x 58. 50/case 38 x 58. 50/case 38 x 58. 100/case 38 x 58 No bid
$10.58/case $10.58/case $28.80/case
.6 mil. 33 gallon .6 mil 33 galon .6 mil 33 gdlon .58 mil 33 galon
9 250/case 33 x 40. 250/case 33 x 40. 250/case 33 x 40. 250/case 33x 39 No bid
$17.28/case $17.28/case $13.50/case
.75 mil 60 galon .75 mil 60 galon .75 mil 60 galon .80 mil 60 galon
10 | 100/case 38 x 58. 100/case 38 x 58. 100/case 38 x 58. 100/case 38 x 58 No bid
$12.34/case $12.34/case $12.75/case
Calico Industries, Inc. Campbell Paper Co.
Virgin Recycled Virgin Recycled
40 mil 7-10 gallon A0 mil 7-10 galon A0 mil 7-10 gallon
1 500/case 23 x 25. 500/case 24 x 24 No Bid 1,000/case 23 x 25 No bid
$7.94/case $9.20/case
40 mil 12-16 gdlon 40 mil 12-16 gdlon A0 mil 12-16 gdlon
2 500/case 23 x 33. 500/ case 24 x 33 No bid 500/case 23 x 33 No bid
$11.3V/case $12.18/case
.75 mil 33 gadlon .75 33 gdlon .75 mil 33 galon
3 150/case 33 x 40. 150/case 33 x 40. No bid 150/case 33 x 40 No bid
$9.14/case $11.50/case
.75 mil 45 galon .75 mil 45 gallon .75 mil 45 gallon
4 100/case 40 x 46. 100/case 40 x 46. No bid 100/case 40x 46 No bid
$8.12/case $9.64/case
.60 mil 33 galon .60 mil 33 galon .60 mil 33 galon
5 250/case 33 x 39. No bid 250/case 33 x 40 250/case 33x 39 No bid
$9.08/case $14.61/case
.65 mil 44 gallon .65 mil 44 galon .65 mil 44 galon
6 100/case 43 x 47. 100/case 43 x 47. No bid 100/case 43 x 47 No bid
$8.52/case $9.94/case
.65 mil 55-60 gallon .65 mil 55-60 gallon .65 mil 55-60 gallon
7 100/case 43 x 47. No bid 100/case 43 x 47. 100/case 43 x 47 No bid
$6.61/case $9.94/case
1.7 mil 55-60 gallon 1.7 mil 55-60 gallon 1.7 mil 55-60 gallon
8 50/case 38 x 58. 50/case 38 x 58. No bid B0/case 38 x 58 No bid
$12.61/case $14.23/case
.6 mil. 33 cgalon .6 mil 33 gdlon .60 mil 33 galon
9 | 250/case 33 x 40. No bid 250/case 33 x 40. 250/case 33 x 40 No bid
$9.90/case $13.70
.75 mil 60 gallon .75 mil 60 galon .75 mil 60 galon
10 | 100/case 38 x 58. 100/case 38 x 58. No bid 100/case 38 x 58 No bid
$11.48/case $12.34/case
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CBI Hedlth Care Central Poly Corp.
Virgin Recycled Virgin Recycled
40 mil 7-10 gallon Amil 7-10 galon 40 mil 7-10 gallon
1 500/case 23 x 25 500/case 23 x 25 No Bid 500/case 23 x 25 No bid
$7.98/case $9.20/case
40 mil 12-16 galon A0 mil 12-16 galon 40 mil 12-16 galon
2 500/case 23 x 33 500/ case 23 x 33 No bid 500/case 23 x 33 No bid
$10.52/case $11.40/case
.75 mil 33 gdlon .75 mil 33 gdlon .75 mil 33 galon .75 mil 33 galon
3 | 150/case 33 x 40 150/case 33 x 40. 150/case 33 x 40. 150/case 33 x 40 No bid
$9.79/case $8.95/case $11.20/case
.75 mil 45 gallon .75 mil 45 galon .75 mil 45 galon .75 mil 45 galon
4 | 100/case 40 x 46 100/case 40 x 46. 100/case 40 x 46. 100/case 40x 46 No bid
$9.09/case $8.31/case $10.20/case
.60 mil 33 galon .60 mil 33 galon .60 mil 33 galon .60mil 33 gallon
5 250/case 33 x 39 250/case 33 x 39. 250/case 33 x 39 250/case 33x 39 No bid
$12.72/case $11.64/case $13.10/case
.65 mil 44 gallon .65 mil 44 gallon .65 mil 44 gallon .65 mil 44 gallon
6 100/case 43 x 47 100/case 43 x 47. 100/case 43 x 47. 100/case 43 x 47 No bid
$8.64/case $7.91/case $9.90/case
.65 mil 55-60 gallon .65 mil 55-60 gdlon .65 mil 55-60 gallon .65 mil 55-60 galon
7 100/case 43 x 47 100/case 43 x 47. 100/case 43 x 47. 100/case 43 x 47 No bid
$8.64/case $7.91/case $10.20/case
1.7 mil 55-60 gallon 1.7 mil 55-60 gallon 1.7 mil 55-60 gallon 1.7 mil 55-60 gallon
8 50/case 38 x 58 50/case 38 x 58. 50/case 38 x 58. 50/case 38 x 58 No bid
$12.98/case $11.28/case $13.40/case
.6 mil. 33 gallon .6 mil 33 gdlon .6 mil 33 gdlon .6 mil 33 gdlon
9 250/case 33 x 40 250/case 33 x 40. 250/case 33 x 40. 250/case 33 x40 No bid
$13.03/case $11.93/case $12.20/case
.75 mil 60 gallon .75 mil 60 gallon .75 mil 60 gallon .75 mil 60 gallon
10 | 100/case 38 x 58 100/case 38 x 58. 100/case 38 x 58. 100/case 38 x 58 No bid
$10.88/case $9.96/case $12.30/case
Commercial Consumer Products DFW Motel Supply & Textiles Inc.
Virgin Recycled Virgin Recycled
40 mil 7-10 gallon 40 mil 7-10 gallon 40 mil 7-10 gallon
1 500/case 23 x 25 500/case 23x 25 No Bid No bid 1,000/case 23 x 25
$7.24/case $16.50/case
40 mil 12-16 gdlon 40 mil 12-16 gdlon 40 mil 12-16 gdlon
2 500/case 23 x 33 500/ case 23 x 33 No bid No bid 1,000/case 23 x 33
$8.99/case $22.95/case
.75 mil 33 gdlon .75 mil 33 gallon .74 mil 33 gallon
3 150/case 33 x 40 150/case 33 x 40. No bid 150/case 33 x 40 No bid
$8.99/case $10.75/case
.75 mil 45 galon .75 mil 45 gdlon 74 mil 45 galon
4 | 100/case 40 x 46 100/case 40 x 46. No bid 100/case 40x 46 No bid
$8.23/case $10.05/case
.60 mil 33 gallon .60 mil 33 galon .74 mil 33 galon .50 mil 33 galon
5 250/case 33 x 39 250/case 33 x 39. No bid 150/case 33 x 40 250/case 33 x 40
$11.44/case $10.75/case $11.45/case
.65 mil 44 gallon .65 mil 44 galon .74 mil 44 gdlon
6 100/case 43 x 47 100/case 43 x 47. No bid 100/case 43 x 47 No bid
$7.86/case $11.00/case
.65 mil 55-60 gallon .65 mil 55-60 gallon .70 mil 55-60 galon
7 100/case 43 x 47 100/case 43 x 47. No bid No bid 100/case 43 x 47
$7.86/case $19.75/case
1.7 mil 55-60 galon 1.7 mil 55-60 galon 1.7 mil 55-60 galon
8 50/case 38 x 58 50/case 38 x 58. No bid No bid 50/case 38 x 58
$13.04/case $12.75/case
.6 mil. 33 gallon .6 mil 33 gdlon .74 mil 33 galon .50 mil 33 galon
9 250/case 33 x 40 250/case 33 x 40. No bid 150/case 33 x 40 250/case 33 x 40
$11.74/case $10.85/case $11.55/case
.75 mil 60 galon .75 mil 60 galon .74 mil 60 galon
10 | 100/case 38 x 58 100/case 38 x 58. No bid 100/case 38 x 58 No bid
$9.83/case $12.05/case
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Diversified Plastics & Packaging Interboro Packaging Corp —BID A
Virgin Recycled Virgin Recycled
40 mil 7-10 gallon 40 mil 7-10 gallon A0 mil 7-10 gallon
1 500/case 23 x 25 No bid No Bid 500/case 24 x 24 500/case 24 x 24
$9.48/case $9.48/case
A0 mil 12-16 gdlon 40 mil 12-16 gdlon A0 mil 12-16 gdlon
2 500/case 23 x 33 No bid No bid 500/case 24 x 33 500/case 24 x 33
$12.68/case $12.68/case
.75 mil 33 gdlon .75 mil 33 gdlon .75 mil 33 galon .75 mil 33 galon .75 mil 33 gdlon
3 150/case 33 x 40 150/case 33 x 40. 150/case 33 x 40. 150/case 33 x 40 150/case 33 x 40
$9.45/case $8.95/case $11.48/case $11.48/case
.75 mil 45 gallon .75 mil 45 galon .75 mil 45 galon .75 mil 45 galon .75 mil 45 galon
4 100/case 40 x 46 100/case 40 x 46. 100/case 40 x 46. 100/case 40 x 46 100/case 40 x 46
$9.45/case $9.25/case $10.34/case $10.34/case
.60 mil 33 galon .60 mil 33 galon .60 mil 33 gallon .60 mil 33 galon .60 mil 33 galon
5 250/case 33 x 39 250/case 33 x 39. 250/case 33 x 39. 250/case 33 x 39 250/case 33 x 39
$13.50/case $12.75/case $13.32/case $13.32/case
.65 mil 44 gallon .65 mil 44 gallon .65 mil 44 gallon .65 mil 55-60 gallon .65 mil 55-60 galon
6 100/case 43 x 47 100/case 43 x 47. 100/case 43 x 47. 100/case 43 x 47 100/case 43 x 47
$11.25/case $10.80/case $10.20/case $10.20/case
.65 mil 55-60 gallon .65 mil 55-60 gdlon .65 mil 55-60 gallon .65 mil 55-60 galon .65 mil 55-60 gdlon
7 100/case 43 x 47 100/case 43 x 47. 100/case 43 x 47. 100/case 43 x 47 100/case 43 x 47
$10.75/case $10.30/case $9.68/case $9.68/case
1.7 mil 55-60 gallon 1.7 mil 55-60 gallon 1.7 mil 55-60 gallon 1.7 mil 55-60 gallon 1.7 mil 55-60 gallon
8 50/case 38 x 58 50/case 38 x 58. 50/case 38 x 58. 50/case 38 x 58 50/case 38 x 58
$13.00/case $12.75/case $15.48/case $15.48/case
.6 mil. 33 gallon .6 mil 33 gdlon .6 mil 33 gdlon .6 mil 33 gdlon .6 mil 33 gdlon
9 250/case 33 x 40 250/case 33 x 40. 250/case 33 x 40. 250/case 33 x x40 250/case 33 x x40
$13.95/case $13.50/case $13.98/case $13.98/case
.75 mil 60 gallon .75 mil 60 gallon .75 mil 60 gallon .75mil 60 gallon .75 mil 60 gallon
10 | 100/case 38 x 58 100/case 38 x 58. 100/case 38 x 58. 100/case 38 x 58 100/case 38 x 58
$11.65/case $11.40/case $12.72/case $12.72/case
Interboro Packaging Corp. BID B Interboro Packaging Corp. BID C
Virgin Recycled Virgin Recycled
40 mil 7-10 gallon 40 mil 7-10 gallon A0 mil 7-10 gallon 40 mil 7-10 gallon 40 mil 7-10 gallon
1 500/case 23 x 25 500/case 23 x 25 500/case 23 x 25 500/case 24 x 24 500/case 24 x 24
$7.98/case $7.98/case $5.98/case $5.98/case
40 mil 12-16 gdlon 40 mil 12-16 gdlon A0 mil 12-16 gallon 40 mil 12-16 gdlon 40 mil 12-16 gdlon
2 500/case 23 x 33 500/case 24 x 33 500/case 24 x 33 500/case 24 x 33 500/case 24 x 33
$9.34/case $9.34/case $7.72/case $7.72/case
.75 mil 33 gdlon .75 mil 33 galon .75 mil 33 gallon .75 mil 33 gallon .75 mil 33 gallon
3 150/case 33 x 40 150/case 33 x 40 150/case 33 x 40 150/case 33 x 40 150/case 33 x 40
$9.48/case $9.48/case $7.34/case $7.34/case
.75 mil 45 galon .75 mil 45 gdlon .75 mil 45 galon .75 mil 45 galon .75 mil 45 gadlon
4 100/case 40 x 46 100/case 40 x 46 100/case 40 x 46 100/case 40 x 48 100/case 40 x 48
$8.82/case $8.82/case $7.84/case $7.84/case
.60 mil 33 gallon .60 mil 33 galon .60 mil 33 gallon .60 mil 33 galon .60 mil 33 galon
5 250/case 33 x 39 250/case 33 x 40 250/case 33 x40 250/case 33 x40 250/case 33 x40
$11.34/case $11.34/case $9.48/case $9.48/case
.65 mil 44 gallon .65 mil 55-60 galon .65 mil 55-60 gallon .65 mil 55-60 gallon .65 mil 55-60 galon
6 100/case 43 x 47 100/case 43 x 48 100/case 43 x 48 100/case 43 x 48 100/case 43 x 48
$9.72/case $9.72/case $8.74/case $8.74/case
.65 mil 55-60 galon .65 mil 55-60 gdlon .65 mil 55-60 gallon .65 mil 55-60 gallon .65 mil 55-60 gdlon
7 100/case 43 x 47 100/case 43 x 48 100/case 43 x 48 100/case 43 x 48 100/case 43 x 48
$9.24/case $9.24/case $8.24/case $8.24/case
1.7 mil 55-60 galon 1.7 mil 55-60 galon 1.7 mil 55-60 gallon 1.7 mil 55-60 galon 1.7 mil 55-60 galon
8 50/case 38 x 58 50/case 38 x 58 50/case 38 x 58 50/case 38 x 58 50/case 38 x 58
$13.98/case $13.98/case $11.48/case $11.48/case
.6 mil. 33 gallon .6 mil 33 gdlon .6 mil 33 gdlon .6 mil 33 gdlon .6 mil 33 gdlon
9 250/case 33 x 40 250/case 33 x 40 250/case 33 x 40 250/case 33 x40 250/case 33 x40
$11.32/case $11.32/case $9.48/case $9.48/case
.75 mil 60 galon .75 mil 60 galon .75 mil 60 galon .75 mil 60 galon .75 mil 60 galon
10 | 100/case 38 x 58 100/case 38 x 58 100/case 38 x 58 100/case 38 x 60 100/case 38 x 60
$10.34/case $10.34/case $8.98/case $8.98/case
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Interboro Packaging Corp BID D L & M Industria Supply, Inc.
Virgin Recycled Virgin Recycled
40 mil 7-10 gallon 40 mil 7-10 gdlon 40 mil 7-10 gdlon 40 mil 7-10 gallon A0 mil 7-10 gallon
1 500/case 23 x 25 500/case 24 x 24 500/case 24 x 24 500/case 23 x 25. 500/case 23 x 25.
$5.98/case $5.98/case $7.28/case $7.12/case
40 mil 12-16 galon A0 mil 12-16 galon A0 mil 12-16 galon 40 mil 12-16 galon A0 mil 12-16 galon
2 500/case 23 x 33 550/case 24 x 33 550/case 24 x 33 500/case 23 x 33. 500/case 23 x 33.
$7.72/case $7.72/case $9.57/case $9.36/case
.75 mil 33 gdlon .75 mil 33 gdlon .75 mil 33 galon .75 mil 33 galon .75 mil 33 gdlon
3 150/case 33 x 40 150/case 33 x 40 150/case 33 x 40 150/case 33 x 40. 150/case 33 x 40.
$6.20/case $6.20/case 9.67/case 8.77/case
.75 mil 45 gallon .75 mil 45 galon .75 mil 45 galon .75 mil 45 galon .75 mil 45 galon
4 100/case 40 x 46 100/case 40 x 48 100/case 40 x 48 100/case 40 x 46. 100/case 40 x 46.
$6.48/case $6.48/case $9.01/case $8.15/case
.60 mil 33 galon .60 mil 33 galon .60 mil 33 galon .60 mil 33 gallon .60 mil 23 galon
5 250/case 33x 39 250/case 33 x40 250/case 33 x40 250/case 33 x 39. 250/case 33 x 39.
$8.70/case $8.70/case $12.53/case $11.39/case
.65 mil 44 gallon .65 mil 55-60 gallon .65 mil 55-60 gallon .65 mil 44 gallon .65 mil 44 gallon
6 100/case 43 x 47 100/case 43 x 48 100/case 43 x 48 100/case 43 x 47. 100/case 43 x 47.
$7.82/case $7.82/case $8.56/case $7.77/case
.65 mil 55-60 gallon .65 mil 55-60 gdlon .65 mil 55-60 gallon .65 mil 55-60 galon .65 mil 55-60 gdlon
7 100/case 43 x 47 100/case 43 x 48 100/case 43 x 48 100/case 43 x 47. 100/case 43 x 47.
$7.34/case $7.34/case $8.56/case $7.77/case
1.7 mil 55-60 gallon 1.7 mil 55-60 gallon 1.7 mil 55-60 gallon 1.7 mil 55-60 gallon 1.7 mil 55-60 gallon
8 50/case 38 x 58 50/case 38 x 58 50/case 38 x 58 50/case 38 x 58. 50/case 38 x 58.
$9.32/case $9.32/case $12.80/case $11.06/case
.6 mil. 33 gallon .6 mil 33 gdlon .6 mil 33 gdlon .60 mil 33 galon .60 mil 33 gadlon
9 250/case 33 x 40 250/case 33 x40 250/case 33 x40 250/case 33 x 40. 250/case 33 x 40.
$9.48/case $9.48/case 12.89/case $11.66/case
.75 mil 60 gallon .75 mil 60 gallon .75 mil 60 gallon .75 mil 60 gallon .75mil 60 gallon
10 | 100/case 38 x 58 100/case 38 x 60 100/case 38 x 60 100/case 38 x 58. 100/case 38 x 58.
$8.32/case $8.32/case $10.80/case $9.78/case
M. A.N. S. Distributors Inc. Pollock Paper, Inc
Virgin Recycled Virgin Recycled
40 mil 7-10 gallon 40 mil 7-10 gallon S5 mil 8-10 gallon
1 500/case 23 x 25 500/case 23x 25 No bid 500/case 24 x 23 No bid
$8.04/case $7.41/case
40 mil 12-16 gdlon 40 mil 12-16 gdlon .35 mil 12-16 gdlon
2 500/case 23 x 33 500/case 23 x 33 No bid 500/case 24 x 32 No bid
$10.62/case $10.43/case
.75 mil 33 gdlon .75 mil 33 gallon .75 mil 33 gallon
3 150/case 33 x 40 150/case 33 x 40 No bid 150/case 33 x 39 No bid
$9.96/case $10.15/case
.75 mil 45 galon .75 mil 45 gdlon .75 mil 40-45 gdlon
4 | 100/case 40 x 46 100/case 40 x 46 No bid 100/case 40 x 46 No bid
$9.07/case $9.63/case
.60 mil 33 galon .60 mil 33 galon .65 mil 33 galon
5 250/case 33 x 39 250/case 33 x 40 No bid 250/case 33x 39 No bid
$11.83/case $14.56/case
.65 mil 44 gallon .65 mil 44 galon .70 mil 56 gallon
6 100/case 43 x 47 100/case 43 x 47 No bid 100/case 43 x 47 No bid
$8.63/case $9.85/case
.65 mil 55-60 gallon .65 mil 55-60 gallon .70 mil 56 gallon
7 100/case 43 x 47 100/case 43 x 47 No bid 100/case 43 x 47 No bid
$7.85/case $9.85/case
1.7 mil 55-60 galon 1.7 mil 55-60 gallon 1.7 mil 60 galon
8 | 50/case 38x 58 50/case 38 x 58 No bid 50/case 38 x 58 No bid
$12.91/case $13.87/case
.6 mil. 33 gallon .60 mil 33 galon .65 mil 33 galon
9 250/case 33 x 40 250/case 33 x 40 No bid 250/case 22 x 39 No bid
$11.84/case $14.56/case
.75 mil 60 galon .75 mil 60 galon .75 mil 60 galon
10 | 100/case 38 x 58 100/case 38 x 58 No bid 100/case 38 x 58 No bid
$10.95/case $11.53/case
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Quill Corporation Unipak Corp
Virgin Recycled Virgin Recycled
40 mil 7-10 gdlon .6 mil 7-10 galon .6 mil 7-10 gallon A0 mil 7-10 gallon
1 500/case 23 x 25 500/case 48 x 23 500/case 48 x 23 No bid 500/case 23 x 25
$15.43/case $14.90/case $7.40/case
40 mil 12-16 galon .31 mil 16 gallon .6 mil 16 gallon A0 mil 12-16 galon
2 500/case 23 x 33 1,000/case 48 x 33 500/case 48 x 31 No bid 500/case 23 x 33
$29.58/case $20.54/case $11.90/case
.75 mil 33 gdlon .8 mil 31-33 gallon 1.35mil 31-33 galon .75 mil 33 gdlon
3 150/case 33 x 40 150/case 33x 39 100/case 33 x 39 No bid 150/case 33 x 40
$22.62/case $15.88/case $11.75/case
.75 mil 45 gallon .6 mil 40-45 gallon .7 mil 40-45 gallon .75 mil 45 galon
4 100/case 40 x 46 250/case 80 x 46 250/case 80 x 46 No bid 100/case 40 x 46
$34.36/case $33.18/case $10.40/case
.60 mil 33 galon .7 mil 33 gdlon .60 mil 33 galon
5 250/case 33 x 39 No bid 40/case 65 x 40 No bid 250/case 33x 39
$5.14/case $13.40/case
.65 mil 44 gallon 9 mil 45 gallon .65 mil 44 gallon
6 100/case 43 x 47 No bid 20/case 70 x 46 No bid 100/case 43 x 47
$5.14/case $9.80/case
.65 mil 55-60 gallon .8 mil 55-60 gallon 9 mil 55-60 gallon .65 mil 55-60 gdlon
7 100/case 43 x 47 100/case 38 x 58 100/case 76 x 58 No bid 100/case 43 x 47
$24.03/case $19.75/case $9.80/case
1.7 mil 55-60 gallon 1.8 mil 55-60 gallon 1.7 mil 55-60 gallon
8 50/case 38 x 58. No bid 100/case 76 x 58 No bid 50/case 38 x 58
$38.88/case $51.00/case
.6 mil. 33 gallon .6 mil 31-33 gallon .7 mil 31-33 gallon .60 mil 33 gadlon
9 250/case 33 x 40 250/case 66 x 39 250/case 66 x 39 No bid 250/case 33 x 40
$22.10/case $21.36/case $13.40/case
.75 mil 60 gallon .75 mil 60 gallon
10 | 100/case 38 x 58 No bid No bid No bid 100/case 38 x 58
$11.70/case




